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The United Methodist Church has a long history of concern for social justice. Its members have often 
taken forthright positions on controversial issues involving Christian principles. Early Methodists 
expressed their opposition to the slave trade, to smuggling, and to the cruel treatment of prisoners. 

A social creed was adopted by The Methodist Episcopal Church (North) in 1908. Within the next 
decade similar statements were adopted by The Methodist Episcopal Church, South, and by The 
Methodist Protestant Church. The Evangelical United Brethren Church adopted a statement of social 
principles in 1946 at the time of the uniting of the United Brethren and The Evangelical Church. In 
1972, four years after the uniting in 1968 of The Methodist Church and The Evangelical United 
Brethren Church, the General Conference of The United Methodist Church adopted a new statement 
of Social Principles, which was revised in 1976 (and by each successive General Conference). 

The Social Principles are a prayerful and thoughtful effort on the part of the General Conference to 
speak to the human issues in the contemporary world from a sound biblical and theological 
foundation as historically demonstrated in United Methodist traditions. They are a call to faithfulness 
and are intended to be instructive and persuasive in the best of the prophetic spirit; however, they are 
not church law.  The Social Principles are a call to all members of The United Methodist Church to a 
prayerful, studied dialogue of faith and practice. (See ¶ 509.) 

Preamble 

We, the people called United Methodists, affirm our faith in God our Creator and Father, in Jesus 
Christ our Savior, and in the Holy Spirit, our Guide and Guard. 

We acknowledge our complete dependence upon God in birth, in life, in death, and in life eternal. 
Secure in God’s love, we affirm the goodness of life and confess our many sins against God’s will for 
us as we find it in Jesus Christ. We have not always been faithful stewards of all that has been 
committed to us by God the Creator. We have been reluctant followers of Jesus Christ in his mission 
to bring all persons into a community of love. Though called by the Holy Spirit to become new 
creatures in Christ, we have resisted the further call to become the people of God in our dealings with 
each other and the earth on which we live. 

Grateful for God’s forgiving love, in which we live and by which we are judged, and affirming our belief 
in the inestimable worth of each individual, we renew our commitment to become faithful witnesses to 
the gospel, not alone to the ends of earth, but also to the depths of our common life and work. 

The Natural World 

All creation is the Lord's, and we are responsible for the ways we use and abuse it. Water, air, soil, 
minerals, energy resources, plants, animal life, and space are to be valued and conserved because 
they are God's creation and not solely because they are useful to human beings. God has granted us 
stewardship of creation. We should meet these stewardship duties through acts of loving care and 
respect. Economic, political, social, and technological developments have increased our human 
numbers, and lengthened and enriched our lives. However, these developments have led to regional 
defoliation, dramatic extinction of species, massive human suffering, overpopulation, and misuse and 
overconsumption of natural and nonrenewable resources, particularly by industrialized societies. This 
continued course of action jeopardizes the natural heritage that God has entrusted to all generations. 
Therefore, let us recognize the responsibility of the church and its members to place a high priority on 
changes in economic, political, social, and technological lifestyles to support a more ecologically 
equitable and sustainable world leading to a higher quality of life for all of God's creation. 

Water, Air, Soil, Minerals, Plants | Energy Resources Utilization | Animal Life | Space & Science and 
Technology | Food Safety  
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The Nurturing Community 

The community provides the potential for nurturing human beings into the fullness of their humanity. 
We believe we have a responsibility to innovate, sponsor, and evaluate new forms of community that 
will encourage development of the fullest potential in individuals. Primary for us is the gospel 
understanding that all persons are important—because they are human beings created by God and 
loved through and by Jesus Christ and not because they have merited significance. We therefore 
support social climates in which human communities are maintained and strengthened for the sake of 
all persons and their growth. We also encourage all individuals to be sensitive to others by using 
appropriate language when referring to all persons. Language of a derogatory nature (with regard to 
race, nationality, ethnic background, gender, sexuality, and physical difference) does not reflect value 
for one another and contradicts the gospel of Jesus Christ. 

The Family | Other Christian Communities | Marriage | Divorce | Single Persons | Women and Men | 
Human Sexuality | Family Violence and Abuse | Sexual Harassment | Abortion | Ministry to Those 

Who Have Experienced an Abortion | Adoption | Faithful Care for Dying Persons  | Suicide 

 

The Social Community 

The rights and privileges a society bestows upon or withholds from those who comprise it indicate the 
relative esteem in which that society holds particular persons and groups of persons.  

We affirm all persons as equally valuable in the sight of God. We therefore work toward societies in 
which each person’s value is recognized, maintained, and strengthened.  

We support the basic rights of all persons to equal access to housing, education, communication, 
employment, medical care, legal redress for grievances, and physical protection. We deplore acts of 
hate or violence against groups or persons based on race, ethnicity, gender, sexual orientation, 
religious affiliation, or economic status. 

Rights of Racial and Ethnic Persons | Rights of Religious Minorities | Rights of Children | Rights of 
Young People | Rights of the Aging | Rights of Women | Rights of Persons with Disabilities | Equal 

Rights Regardless of Sexual Orientation | Population | Alcohol and Other Drugs | Tobacco | Medical 
Experimentation | Genetic Technology | Rural Life | Sustainable Agriculture | Urban-Suburban Life | 
Media Violence and Christian Values | Information Communication Technology | Persons Living with 

HIV and AIDS | Right to Health Care | Organ Transplantation and Donation 

 

The Economic Community 

We claim all economic systems to be under the judgment of God no less than other facets of the 
created order. Therefore, we recognize the responsibility of governments to develop and implement 
sound fiscal and monetary policies that provide for the economic life of individuals and corporate 
entities and that ensure full employment and adequate incomes with a minimum of inflation. We 
believe private and public economic enterprises are responsible for the social costs of doing 
business, such as employment and environmental pollution, and that they should be held accountable 
for these costs. We support measures that would reduce the concentration of wealth in the hands of a 
few. We further support efforts to revise tax structures and to eliminate governmental support 
programs that now benefit the wealthy at the expense of other persons. 

 
Property | Collective Bargaining | Work and Leisure | Consumption | Poverty | Migrant Workers | 

Gambling | Family Farms | Corporate Responsibility | Trade and Investment 

 

 

http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1720
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1721
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1722
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1723
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1724
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1725
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1728
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1730
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1731
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1732
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?ptid=3&mid=6379
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?ptid=3&mid=6379
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1733
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?ptid=1&mid=1734
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1735
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1746
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1747
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1748
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1749
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1749
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1750
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1751
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1752
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1753
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1753
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1754
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1755
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1756
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1757
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1757
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1758
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1759
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1760
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1761
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1762
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?ptid=1&mid=1763
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1764
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1764
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1765
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1766
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?ptid=1&mid=1737
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1738
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1739
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1740
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1741
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1742
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1743
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1744
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?mid=1745
http://archives.umc.org/interior.asp?ptid=1&mid=6383


The Political Community 

While our allegiance to God takes precedence over our allegiance to any state, we acknowledge the 
vital function of government as a principal vehicle for the ordering of society.  

Because we know ourselves to be responsible to God for social and political life, we declare the 
following relative to governments: 

Basic Freedoms & Human Rights | Political Responsibility | Church and State Relations | Freedom of 
Information | Education | Civil Obedience and Civil Disobedience | The Death Penalty | Criminal and 

Restorative Justice | Military Service 

The World Community 

God’s world is one world. The unity now being thrust upon us by technological revolution has far 
outrun our moral and spiritual capacity to achieve a stable world. The enforced unity of humanity, 
increasingly evident on all levels of life, presents the Church as well as all people with problems that 
will not wait for answer: injustice, war, exploitation, privilege, population, international ecological 
crisis, proliferation of arsenals of nuclear weapons, development of transnational business 
organizations that operate beyond the effective control of any governmental structure, and the 
increase of tyranny in all its forms. This generation must find viable answers to these and related 
questions if humanity is to continue on this earth. We commit ourselves as a Church to the 
achievement of a world community that is a fellowship of persons who honestly love one another. We 
pledge ourselves to seek the meaning of the gospel in all issues that divide people and threaten the 
growth of world community. 

Nations and Cultures | National Power and Responsibility | War and Peace | Justice and Law 

 

Our Social Creed 

We believe in God, Creator of the world; and in Jesus Christ, the Redeemer of creation. We believe in 
the Holy Spirit, through whom we acknowledge God’s gifts, and we repent of our sin in misusing 
these gifts to idolatrous ends. 

We affirm the natural world as God’s handiwork and dedicate ourselves to its preservation, 
enhancement, and faithful use by humankind. 

We joyfully receive for ourselves and others the blessings of community, sexuality, marriage, and the 
family. 

We commit ourselves to the rights of men, women, children, youth, young adults, the aging, and 
people with disabilities; to improvement of the quality of life; and to the rights and dignity of racial, 
ethnic, and religious minorities. 

We believe in the right and duty of persons to work for the glory of God and the good of themselves 
and others and in the protection of their welfare in so doing; in the rights to property as a trust from 
God, collective bargaining, and responsible consumption; and in the elimination of economic and 
social distress. 

We dedicate ourselves to peace throughout the world, to the rule of justice and law among nations, 
and to individual freedom for all people of the world. 

We believe in the present and final triumph of God’s Word in human affairs and gladly accept our 
commission to manifest the life of the gospel in the world. Amen. 

 

From The Book of Discipline of The United Methodist Church - 2000. Copyright 2000 by The United Methodist Publishing House. Used by permission. 
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